
Monday, October 30, 1989

Daily Digest

Senate
Chamber Action

The Senate was not in ses
meet on Tuesday, October 31

Committee Meetilgs
sion today. It will next
, at 11:30 a.m.

No committee meetings A~ere held.

*2 _________________

Hohse of Representativ
Chamber Action
Bill Introduced: 1 private
duced.

Reports Filed: Reports we
H.R. 3265, to amend thi

1934 to provide authorizat
the Federal Communicatio:
(H. Rept. 101-316, filed on
.H.R. 3310, to authorize

ties of the National Teleca
mation Administration for
(H. Rept. 101-317, filed on

H.R. 3021, to extend the
eral Power Act applicable
hydroelectric project in tl
amended (H. Rept. 101-311

H;R. 3318, to redesigns
known as the Concord I
Smith Street in Houston,
Leland Federal Building'
101-319);

H.R. 2581, to authorize
ministration to establish a:
program, amended (H. Re

H.R. 897, authorizing tl
Atmospheric Administrati
expand its fleet of ocean r
(I-H. Rept. 101-321).

Presidential Veto Mes
tions: Read a message frc
he announces his veto of ]
priations for the District o
tivities chargeable in who
revenue of said District f

bil, H.R. 3543 was intro-

Page H7762

filed as follows:
.ommunications Act of
L of appropriations for
Commission, amended
ctober 27);
!propriations for activi-
~munications and Infor-
:al years 1990 and 1991
ctober 27);
adlines under-the Fed-
the construction of a
State of Washington,

the Federal building,
ding, located at 1919
Texas as the "Mickey
amended (H. Rept.

Federal Aviation Ad-
viation research grant
101-320); and
National Oceanic and

to modernize and
arch vessels, amended

;e-D.C. AI
the President
t. 3026, maki:
;olumbia and
or in part ag
the fiscal yea

September 30, 1990, and ex
for-ordered printed (H.
that consideration of the vet
until Wednesday, Novembe

&

dains his reasons there-
)oc. 101-105). Agreed
) message be postponed
1.

Pa. H7728

Suspensions: House voted to suspend the rules and]Ipass the following measures:

Veterans health professiona
amended, to amend title 38
establish a program to pro'
cation assistance to studen
who are eligible for educat
Reserve GI Bill program i
service with the Departmc
Agreed to amend the title;

Veterans education amendme
to amend title 30, United
to certain veterans' educati

Lou,-le'el radioactrie waste
amended, granting the co
amendments to the South
Radioactive Waste Manage

Poo er project time limization.
deadlines under the Federal
the construction of a hyd

?'9s, u7762 State of Washington.
ppropria- Subsequently, this passag
t wherein lar Senate-passed bill, S. 75(
ng appro- being amended to contai
other ac- House bill as passed. Agrc

gainst the the Senate bill;
ar ending

I --

s education: H.R. 3199,
United States Code, to

ide post-secondary edu-
in health professions

on assistance under the
return- for subsequent

nt of Veterans Affairs.

Page H7739

ts: H.R. 3390, amended,
ates Code, with respect

programs;
Page H7742

management: H.R. 2642,
sent of the Congress to
ast Interstate Low-Level
ient Compact;

Page H7747

H.R. 3021, to extend the
Power Act applicable to

·oelectric project in the

was vacated and a sirni-
was passed in lieu after

n the language of the
ed to amend the title of

Page H7749

D 1259



CO (GRESSIONAL RE(

N7/i1 ,a;ilhorizativn: I- .R. 331 ), to autthorize appro-
Friations for activities of the N tional Telecommuni-

c,;jions and Information Ad inistration for fiscal
ycars 1990 and 1991;

.FCC authorization: H.R. 3265, amended, to amend
l:e Communications Act of 1934 to provide authori-
zation of appropriations for the Federal Communica-
ions Commission;

Page H7752 L
Mil.P. Daniel and Thomas Fi. 'al/oon, Sr., Post Office

Builditng: H.R. 922, to designat
at 1515 Sam Houston Street in
"M.P. Daniel and Thomas F.
Office Building"; and

Mlickey Leland Federal building.
to redesignate the Federal bu
Concord Building, located at
Houston, Texas, as the "Mi
Building". Agreed to amend d

Consent Calendar: Agreed th:
to authorize the exercise of St
portion of Indian country 1h
County, Oklahoma, be strickt
Calendar.

Referrals: Twelve Senate-pass,
ferred to the appropriate Hous

Senate Messages: Senate me,
appear on page H7737.
Amendments: Amendments
ant to the rule appear on page

Quorum Calls-Votes: No
developed during the proce
today.

Adjournment: Met at noon
p.m.

Committee Meetin
ANTIDRUG ABUSE AUT
ComWittee on Energy and Comm
Health and the Environment
1735, to provide authorizatio
appropriations, and similar a
fmony was heard from Repr
rence H. Thompson, Assista
Human Resources, GAO; and

hMISSILE TECHNOLOGY
CONTROL REGIME
Complmittee on Foreign Affairs: S
Control, International Securit

* the building located
Liberty, Texas, as the
:alhoon, Senior, Post

Page H7755

H.R. 3318, amended,
Iding, known as the
ylvJ CmLtn
yly-. O111L.L

:key Lelanc
e title;

it the: bill, I-
ite jurisdicti¢
)cated in C
In from the

d measures
committee.

ages receiv

ered print

'ORD -- DAI Y DIG EST

Subcommittee on lnternationt
Trade held a joint hearing c

'Control Regime. Testimony
Clarke, Assistant Secretary, B
tary Affairs, Department of
Deputy, Nonproliferation Pol
rity Affairs, Department of D(
Deputy Assistant Secretary, I
Department of Commerce; an
Assistant Director, Nuclear
U.S. Arms Control and Disarn

October ,70. 1989

I Economic :Policy and
n Missile Technology
as heard from Richard
ureau of Politico-Mfili-
ktate; Henry Sokolski,
cy, International Secu-
,fense: Jim LeMunyon,
.xport Administration,
i Norm Wulf, Deputy
nd Weapons Control,
iament Agency.

· ~ -f !

COMMITTEE ME1
TUESDAY, OCTO

rINGS FOR
3ER 31, 1989

(Commitee meetings are open untless otheruaise indicated)

Senate
OILIre n Committee on Banking, HousinE

I Federal hold hearings to examine the:
government sponsored enterpt

Page 177156 SD-538.
I.R. 2854, Full Committee, to resume
on over a review the investigation of the 1-H
:ornanche tion program (Section 8), 2:30 p.i

Consent Committee on Energy and Nal
hearings on the Department o

Page n748 prove the operations and ma
;w sere re- energy defense activities and its

credibility in the Department's
Page H7761

S. 972, S. 13A04, and other related
'ed today the environment, safety, and h

of the Department of Energy
ed pursu- am., SD-366.

7762. s r vt
uorum calls or votes
dings of the House

nd adjourned at 1:55

IS

[ORIZATION
'rce: Subcommittee on
held a hearing on S.
,s for antidrug abuse
d related bills. Testi-
sentative Stark; Law-

Controller General,
public witnesses.

Committee on Foreign Relations,
hearings on S. 1227, to restrict
and missile equipment and ted
provide for sanctions on person!
otherwise engage in the trade of
of laws and regulations implemi
nology Control Regime (MTCR

Committee on the Judiciary. to
drug abuse prevention campaign

Comittree on Labor and Huma;
ings on S. 1675, to provide finar
recruitment and training, and S
teaching profession, 9:30 a.m., S]

Subcommittee on Education,
hold hearings on S. 1540, to esta
for critical languages and area
mentary and secondary schools
programs to improve foreign
p.m., SD-430.

and Urban Affairs, to
afety and soundness of
ses (GSE's), 10 a.m.,

oversight hearings to
D moderate rehabilita-

., SD-538.
Ia Resources, to resume

Energy's efforts to im-
agement of its atomic
efforts to restore public
ility to operate its facili-
sound manner, and on

measures with respect to
lth aspects of operation

nuclear facilities, 9:30

to hold open and closed
iproliferation of missiles
nology, and S. 1421,- to-
who export, transfer, or
certain items in violation
inting the Military Tech-
,10 a.m., SD-419.
hold hearings to review
;, 11 a.m., SD-226.
i Resources. to hold hear-
cial assistance for teacher
. 1676, to strengthen the
)-430.
krts, and Humanities, to
blish a program of grants
studies programs in ele-
and S. 1690, to establish
rnguage instruction, 2:30

NOTI E

ibcommittee on Arms
and Science and the

For a listing of Senate con rnittee meetings sched-
uled ahead, see page E3601 itJ today's Record.

. . ....



H 7752
munications Scienres a
Analysis.

Finally, NTIA administ
sion Facilities Program
matching grant program
television and public ra
have made great strides
evision and radio to all A
much ground to cover.
determined that althoug
U.S. population receives
air public television sign
the population receives
radio signal. PTFP plays
continuing campaign to
sion and radio coverage.

To fulfill its responsib
not only adequate fundi
independence and visi
1989, then Secretary of
Verity, announced or
within the Commerce
have reduced NTIA's
Under the Verity plan,
the Under Secretary
than directly to the Secr
ability to promote nation
policies within the admi
international forum. In
Chairman DINGELL,
and other Members to r
the appropriateness of
where telecommunicati
closely linked to Amei
Recently, Secretary R
nounced plans to resto
status within the Commer
plaud this action, and I
newed appreciation for t
strong, comprehensive n
cations policy, not only b
also within the Bush admii

The funding levels for
this legislation are consis
of the agency and the n(
ment in the development
our national policy for t
munications industry. I urt
support this legislation.

Mr. MOORHEAD.
yield myself such tin
slume.

Mr. Speaker, I urge
Prove this legislatic
funds for NTIA, the
Policy Adviser on teli
issues.

I certainly congrati
man from Mass:
MARKEY] and the geni
Jersey [Mr. RINALDO]
they have shown on
are before us on tel,
issues.

For those of you m
opportunity to visit .
nia and see the work
where there are all
mentations going on
the telephone compa
units in the most m(
that are available to
tions and to give the
tunity to see them in
tainly are encouragec
development.

This is a clean bill,
tive legislation. Its ft

CO
d its Office of Policy

!rs the Public Televi-
'TFP], a competitive
that supports public
o facilities. While we
in bringing public tel-
nericans, there is still
k recent NTIA study
1 94 percent of the
at least one over the
I, only 86 percent of
at least one public
a crucial role in the
Ixpand public televi-

lities, NTIA requires
ig but also sufficient
lity. On January 6,
ommerce, C. Wiliam
nizational changes
partment that would
us and autonomy.

IA was to report to
Technology rather

tary undermining its
telecommunications
istraton and in an

nse, I joined with
ressman RINALDO,
se concerns about
s change in an era

industries are so
s economic future.
rt Mosbacher an-

NTIA's independent
Department I ap-

lieve it reflects re-
e importance of a

tional telecommuni-
the Congress, but

istration.
NTIA contained in
ent with the needs
eds of our Govern-
and coordination of
e critical telecom-
e ny colleagues to

Mr. Speaker, I
e as I may con-

he House to ap-
to authorize

"resident's Chief
ommunications

late the gentle-
chusetts [Mr.
leman from New
or the foresight
the issues that
icommunications

ho have had an
uthern Califor-

at Cerritos, CA,
inds of experi-
with cable, with
ies, with other

dern techniques
telecommuniea-
eople an oppor-

action, they cer-
by this kind of

free of substan-
ding levels are

NGRESSIONAL
not controversial,
the President's bu
authorization will
runs at full streno
fiscal years and ci
work.

RECORD - HOI
tnd do not exceed
dget request. This
insure that NTIA
th for the next 2
a continue its fine

11250
The minority m(

mittee on Energy l
no objections to ti
urge the House to

Mr. Speaker, I
quests for time, as
balance of my time

Mr. MARKEY, .
myself such time-
and I will consum(
30 seconds, and t1
that the last adm:
process which wou]
status of the NTIA
think, deemphasiz
our ability to be a
focus to telecommi
terpiece for ensri
States does becoi
States of America
our world primacl
sphere by the year

Thankfully Seci
the new Secretary
made the decision
elevate it, that he
and, in fact, enhar
this agency and to
give it the attentio
bility which it nee
can work togethe
basis with the adm
policies.

The gentleman f
DINGELL] and I, tk
members, the ger
York [Mr. LENT],
New Jersey [Mr.
down the line all
put these issues t

I hope the H
place of legislatio

Mr. Speaker, I
quests for time,
balance of my tim

Mr. SPEAKER
MONTGOMERY). T
motion offered by
Massachusetts [
House suspend th
bill, H.R. 3310.

The question w
thirds having vot
the rules were sus
was passed.

A motion to rec
the table.

GENERY
Mr. MARKEY.

unanimous consen
may have 5 legislat
revise and extend
include extraneou
3310, the bill just V

Mr. SPEAKER p
objection to the re
man from Massach

There was no obj

bers of the Com-
d Commerce have
e legLslat-on, and I

Ipport it.
e no further re-
I yield back the

Speaker, I yield
I may consume,

just an additional
at is only to note
nistration began a
d have reduced the
and in a fashion, I
id or undermined
)le to give the full
nications as a cen-
ig that the United
le the Electronic
in order to retain

in the economic
000 and beyond.

etary Mosbacher,
of Commerce, has
:hat he is going to
is going to retain,
ce, the position of
give it the luster,
a, give it the credi-
is. That means we

on a bipartisan
nistration on these

·om Michigan [Mr.
ranking minority

tleman from New
ae gentleman from
RNALDno], and on
vorked together to
Ather.
;e can accept this

ave no further re-
d I yield back the

pro tempore (Mr.
question is on the
he gentleman from
MARKEY] that the
rules and pass the

taken; and (two-
in favor thereof)

ended and the bill

,nsider was laid on

L LEAVE
Mr. Speaker, I ask

that all Members
ive days in which to
their remarks and
material on H.R.

assed.
ro tempore. Is there
quest of the gentle-
usetts?
ection.

USE
FEDERAL

COMMIS

October 30, 1989
COMMUNICATIONS

ZSION AUTHRIZA TIN
ACT OF 1989
Mr. MARKEY. Mr. Speaker, I mlove

to suspend the rules and pass tbhe bill
(H.R. 3265) to amend the Communica-
tions Act of 1934 to provide authloriza-
tion of appropriations for the Pederal
Communications Commission, a-rd for
other purposes, as amended.

The Clerk read as follows:
H.R. 3265

Be it enacted by the Senate and Howse of
Representatives of the United Stace.s of
America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the "P7tederal
Communications Commission Authorization
Act of 1989".
SEC. 2. AtlriORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIOS.

Section 6 of the Communications Act of
1934 (47 U.S.C. 156) is amended to read as
follows:

"AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS
"SEC. 6. (a) There are authorized to Ibe ap-

propriated for the administration oaf this
Act by the Commission $109,831,0[0 for
fiscal year 1990 and $121,478,000 for -fiscal
year 1991, together with such sums as may
be necessary for increases resulting fram ad-
justments in salary, pay, retirement, -other
employee benefits required by la,. and
other nondiscretionary costs, for each aof the
fiscal years 1990 and 1991.

"(b) In addition to the amounts aujthor-
ized to be appropriated under this section,
not more than 4 percent of the amount of
any fees or other charges payable to the
United States which are collected by the
Commission are authorized to be made
available to the Commission until expended
to defray the full distributed costs of such
fees collection.

"(c) Of the amounts appropriated Ipursu-
ant to subsection (a) for fiscal year 1991,
such sums as may be necessary mot to
exceed $2,000,000 shall be expended £wr up-
grading and modernizing equipment mt the
Commission's electronic emissions test labo-
ratory located in Laurel alaaryland".
SEC. 3. COMMERCIAL RADIO OPERATOR FMYAMINA-

TIONS
Section 4(f) of the Communications Act of

1934 (47 U.S.C. 154(f)) is amended by adding
at the end the following new paragraph:

"(5)(A) The Commission, for purposes of
preparing and administering any examina-
tion for a commerical radio operator license
or endorsement, may accept and employ the
services of persons that the Commission de-
termines to be qualified. Any person so em-
ployed may not receive compensation for
such services, but may recover from excamin-
ees such fees as the Commission Perrmits.
considering such factors as public service
and cost estimates submitted by such
person.
"(B) The Commission may prescribe regu-

lations to select, oversee, sanction, arnd dis-
miss any person authorized under this para-
graph to be employed by the Commissaion.

"(C) Any person who provides services
under this paragraph or who provides; goods
in connection with such services sh&am not.
by reason of having provided such service or
goods, be considered a Federal or aspecial
government employee.".
SMEC 4. TRAVEI. REIMI1;ARSEMFN' PROGRAX.

Section 4(g)(2)(D1 of the Communications
Act of 1934 (47 U.S.C. 154(g)(2X)()) is
amended by strikipg "1989" and ihserting
"1991".

L



October 30, 198,9 CONGRESSIONAL RECORD - HOUSE
.t;C. 5. COMiIUtNICATIONS Stl'l'OlRT FROM Ol.lfEK

AMERICANS.
Section 8(a) of the Federal Conununica-

fielns Commission Auttorization Act of 1938
,.4i U.S.C. 154 note) is amended by striking
,"and 1989" and inserting ", 1989, 1990, and
1991".
SEC. 6. TARIFF NOTICE PERIOD.

Section 203(b) of the Communications Act
of 1934 (47 U.S.C. 203(b)) is amended-

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking "ninety
days notice" and inserting "120 days'
notice"; and

(2) in paragraph (2). by striking "ninety
days" and inserting "120 days".
SEC. 7. AMATEUR RADIO SERVICE RECIPR(OCAl.

PERMITS.
(a) IR GZNERAL.--Section 303(1)X3) of the

Communications Act of 1934 (47 U.S.C.
303tl,)3)) is amended by striking "bilateral
agreement between the United States and
the alien's government" and inserting "mul-
tilateral or bilateral agreement, to which
the United States and the alien's govern-
ment are parties,".

(b)-- CONFORMING AMEXDMENT,.-Section
310(c) of the Communications Act of 1934
(47 U.S.C. 310(c)) is amended by striking
"bilateral agreement between the United
States and the alien's government" and in-
serting "multilateral or bilateral agreement,
to which the United States and the alien's
goverrnment are parties,".
SEC. 8. WILLFUL OR MAI.ICIOUTS INTERFERENCE.

Part I of title III of the Communications
Act of 1934 (47 U.S.C. 301 et seq.) Is amend-
ed by adding at the end the following newv
section:

"WILLFUL OR MALICIOUS INTEInRIF SENCE
"SEc. 333. No person shall willfully or ma-

liciously interfere with or cause interference
to any radio communications of any station
licensed or authorized by or under this Act
or operated by the United States Govern-
ment.".
SEC. 9. CONSIDERATION OF IMPACT ON COMIMERCE

IN PUBLIC INTEREST DETERMINA-
TIONS.

Section 4 of Communications Act of 1934
(4I'U.S.C. 154) is amended by adding-at the
end thereof the following new subsection:

"(p) In making any finding with resect to
the public interest as required for purposes
of any decision or determination under this
Act (other than a decision or determinatior.
with respect to the certification of equip-
ment), the Commission may, in its discre-
tion, assess the impact of that decision or
determination on the foreign commerce of
the United States.".

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Is a
second demanded?

Mr. MOORHEAD. Mr. Speaker, I
demand a second.

The SPEAKER pro tempore. With-
out objection, a second will be consid-
ered as ordered.

There was no objection.
The SPEAKER pro tempore. The

gentleman from Massachusetts [Mr.
MARKEY] will be recognized for 20 min-
uteas. and the gentleman from Califor-
nia [Mr. MOORHEAD] will be recognized
for 20 minutes.

The Chair recognizes the gentleman
from Massachusetts [Mr. MARKEY].

Mr. MARKEY. Mr. Speaker, I yield
myself such time as I may consume.

Mr. Speaker, although the point
does not have to be made, I think at
the same time it bears repeating, and
that is that the legislation which we
have produced is something which is
done on a bipartisan basis. Our entire

committee, from the gentleman from
Michigan [Mr. DINGELL] on down.
really do believe it is critical for us to
have a comprehensive national policy
which will make it possible for us to
fully capture all the opportunities
which this global telecommnunications
revolution is offering to us.

The Federal CommunicationLs Conm-
mission. along with the NTIA, are the
two key agencies. It would be like
trying to separate Babe Ruth and Loll
Gehrig. One really cannot do it. They
each have worked together, and they
have to be complementary. We have to
have some sense of a common direc-
tion that we are going to be going in
this area of telecommunications. That
is why this legislation, as amended, in-
creases funding for the FCC for fiscal
year 1991.

When the Commission provided the
subcommittee with its initial estimate
regarding its requirements for fiscal
year 1991, it requested outlays of
$117.8 million. Subsequently, the Com-
mission initiated a comprehensive
review of its requirements and deter-
mined that an additional $3.7 million
would be required for full funding of
the agency's needs, bringing the total
fiscal year 1991 funding to $121.5 mil-
lion.

0 1300
The Commission asserted that the

additional $3.7 million would permit
the repair and the replacement of an-
tiquated technical equipment, the im-
provement of the FCC's computer op-
erations, the replacement of motor ve-
hicles used for field monitoring and
enforcement operations and the hiring
of new employees.

We support this. We believe this is
critical, that we give this kind of sup-
port to the Federal Communications
Commission, that we continually iden-
tify where the opportunities are for
the American society to move into
these critical areas and to take full op-
portunity for all our citizens.

That is why this bill is here on a bi-
partisan basis. It seeks to once again
build that bridge which is going to be
necessary in our country if we are to
compete internationally.

The FCC plays a critical role in that
issue, along with the NTIA. Our hope
is the bill can be accepted unanimous-
ly by the Congress because that sends
the right signal to the agency and to
the rest of the world that we are seri-
ous about international competition in
the telecommunications area.

Mr. Speaker, I rise in support of H.R. 3265.
the Federal Communications Commission Au-
thorization Act of 1989 which authorizes for
fiscal years 1990 and 1991.

Today, as we enter an unprecedontecr
period in the evolution of America's telecom-
munications industries, the role of the FCC is
critical to promoting a competitive market
place, providing timely and effective regula-
tion, and encouraging the continued deveiop-
ment of efficient, innovative communications'
facilities and services. This independen,,
agency must have the resources needed ton

-implement congressional policies, to regulate
the dynamic, burgeoning telecommunications
industry and to carry out its statutory responsi-
bilities to promote the public interest.

The Commission and its, staff must not only
be able to manage new sophisticated technol-
ogies and the complex domestic marketplace
4n which they reside but also understand how
emerging technologies will affect U.S. com-
petitiveness and our economic primacy as we
prepare for the year 2000. The legislation we
are considering today will ensure that the FCC
ihas adequate resources to meet its growing
mandate.

During the subcommittee markup I offered
9on behalf of myself and my good friend, the
gentieman from New Jersey [Mr. RINALDO] an
amendmont in the nature of a substitute. The
legislation before us today contains several
provisions requested by the Commission that
were added during subcommittee markup and
that s!gnificantly improved the legislation.

The legislation, as amended, increases
'funding for the FCC for fiscal year 1991.
'When the Commission provided the subcom-
imittee an initial estimate regarding its require-
ments for fiscal year 1991, it requested out-
lays totaling $117.8 million. Subsequently, the
Commission initiated a comprehensive review
*of its requirements and determined that an ad-
ditional $3.7 million would be required for full
funding of the agency's needs, bringing the
total fiscal year 1991 request to $121.5 mil-
lion. The Commission asserts that the addi-
tional $3.7 million will permit the repair and re-
.placement of antiquated technical equipment,
the improvement of the FCC's computer oper-
ations, the replacement of motor vehicles
used for field monitoring and enforcement op-
erations and the hiring of new employees to
replace personnel who left, but were not re-
placed, during the Commission's 2-year hiring
freeze.

The Commission has enormous responsibil-
ities in this rapidly changing technological en-
vironment. As we in Congress press the Com-
mission to reduce delays when considering
applications, to speed up its testing and type
processing activities and to increase its en-
forcement activities, I believe it imperative that
we provide it adequate resources to fulfill its
statutory mandate. I support the Commission's
request for a small increase in its authorized
funding level.

H.R. 3265, as amended, also makes several
other noncontroversial, but important, changes
in existing Commission policy and procedure.
First the legislation would permit the FCC to
delegate Its commercial radio operator exami-
nation services to outside parties. The legisla-
tion also would authorize the Commission to
make changes in amateur radio reciprocal
permits. Under the legislation, amateur radio
operations in the United States would be per-
mitted to operate radio equipment in any
country that is party to the multilateral agree-
ment.

The Commission also requested inclusion in
this legislative package language prohibiting
willful or malicious interference to radio com-
munications. The language contained in H.R.
3265 substantially would assist the Conmmis-
sion in curtailing willful and malicious interfer-
ence by clearly making such activity a criminal
offense subject to fines of up to $10,000 or
imprisonment for up to 1 year, or both, for a
first offense, aAd the same fine limitations and

11 7753



CONGRESSIONAL RECORD - HOUSE
up to 2 years imprisonment for repeated of-
fenses.

The legislation permits the Commission to
retain not more than 4 percent of the amount
of any fees or other charges collected by the
Commission to defray the cost of such collec-
tion. In the recent budget reconciliation pack-
age, the House and Senate agreed on an ex-
panded fee program for the FCC. Implementa-
tion of the tee program by the FCC will require
utilization of additional resources, and this
amendment will ensure that the Commission
has those resources. The 4-percent figure
contained in this substitute reflects a compro-
mise between the 6-percent figure requested
by the Commission and the 2-percent figure
contained in the Senate authorization legisla-
tion.

In addition, the full committee adopted a
provision to clarify and make explicit the Com-
mission's existing authority to assess the
effect of each of its decisions or determina-
tions on foreign commerce of the United
States. In adopting this provision the commit-
tee was expressing the concerns that while
the United States has a policy of open entry
into our telecommunications market the poli-
cies of foreign nations are impeding the ability
of U.S. companies to offer their telecommuni-
cations services abroad.

I believe this legislation will meet the current
and anticipated needs of the Commission, and
I urge the members of the full committee to
join me in supporting the bill.

Mr. MARKEY. Mr. Speaker, I yield
such time as he may consume to the
gentleman from Washington [Mr.
SwIrrFT].

(Mr. SWIFT asked and was given
permission to revise and extend his re-
marks.)

Mr. SWIFT. Mr. Speaker, I thank
the gentleman for yielding me this
time.

I just wish to make a couple of
points in relation to this authoriza-
tion.

Mr. Speaker, first of all, the Federal
Communications Commission is a reg-
ulatory agency that has over a period
of most recent years done a lot of de-
regulation. This would lead one intu-
itively to assume that their regulatory
responsibility was less, that they
might be able to do it with less person-
nel, that they might be able to carry
out their responsibilities with less
money. The fact is that deregulation
in the communications industry has
meant', inadvertently perhaps, the pro-
liferatiorn of companies to be regulat-
ed. For exmaple, in the telephone in-
dustry alone, it used to be that if one
did an adequate job of regulating
AT&T, they pretty well covered the
waterfront. AT&T was broken up, and
n'ow we have seven regional operating
companies plus AT&T, so we have, in
a sense. increased the regulatory re-
sponsibility eightfold, in addition to
Which the FCC presides over an area
in which technology is absolutely ex-
Ploding. The regulatory responsibil-
ities of the FCC are greater.

Mr. Speaker, I have been a fairly
vocal critic of recent Federal Commu-
nications Commissions. I have high
hopes -for the current Commission as

being one that Congress can work
with. I believe that Congress has a
possibility of overregulating because
of past experience with a Commission
that did not want to do its job and its
regulatory responsibilities. That can
mean that for some time we can over-
legislate. We can intrude too deeply
into details that ought to be left alone
for a regulatory agency.

I would hope that those at OMB
who seem to have the final word in all
of these things -would realize that,
first, the regulatory responsibilities of
this particular Conunission have not
been reduced, that technological
change, in fact, is increasing their reg-
ulatory responsibilities, and that the
greatest assurance that there will not
be overdrafting of legislation by Con-
gress is for Congress to be comfortable
that the agency with the regulatory
authority has all of the resources nec-
essary to do a crackerjack job of regu-
lation. I believe this FCC has the will,
but I am not at all sure that it has the
means, and as the current members of
the Commission get into their jobs
more thoroughly and as they begin to
make their recommendations to the
administration on what their budget
needs are in order to be able to do
their job adequately, it is my hope
that OMB will understand that the
judgments it makes in that regard are
crucial to the effectiveness of the
agency at hand.

The other point that I would like to
raise is I believe the committee at
some point in the future needs to ex-
amine as to whether or not we need to
extend just a touch more authority to
the FCC. In this respect, there are de-
cisions being made by the FAA, the
Federal Aeronautics Administration,
which impinge on some of the respon-
sibilities of the FCC. An example is a
building in the city of Seattle which
the FAA permitted to be built at a cer-
tain height, the building of which
interfered with the signals of three
major television stations in Seattle. It
seems to me that consulting with the
FCC prior to that decision would have
been appropriate.

Interestingly enough, those televi-
sion stations now need to raise their
towers in order to clarify their signals
again. Who are they dealinig with pri-
marily? With the FAA. Clearly this is
an area in which we have legitimate
but conflicting governmental concerns
in both agencies, and I would hope
that we can provide a means in next
year's legislation that will see that the
FCC gets an opportunity to express its
concerns and its policy problems with
decisions made by the FAA where
those two agencies' authority come
into juxtaposition,. I think this should
be done with appropriate consultation
with other authorization committees
in the Congress, not looking to have
any interference with the responsibil-
ities of the FAA in its pursuit'of safety
questions dealing with air travel at all,
but I think they should not be able to
make their judgment unilaterally

without input from the regulatory
agency which has the responsibility to
be sure that.the broadcasting .tatiolns
of America ,:an carry out their work
without interference.

Those are two things for the future.
Mr. MOORHEAD. Mr. Speaker, I

yield myself such time as I may con-
sume.

Mr. Speaker, I urge my colleagues to
support the FCC authorization bill as
amended by the Energy and Com-
merce Committee.

This bill is free of controversial
items. It provides the FCC with the
full amount it requested for fiscal
1990. It also gives the agency a $12
million increase in funding for fiscal
1991, to $121 million. This takes into
account the costs associated with the
FCC's move to new quarters, as well as
funding to refurbish its lab and get
the agency back to full strength. It is
money that the agency sorely needs.

The committee added an amend-
mient to make explicit the FCC's au--
thority with respect to trade policy.
The committee's majority and minori-
ty worked together on this amend-
ment, and it passed the committee by
voice vote.

The administration's fears that this
amendment may direct the Commis-
sion to make trade policy have been
addessed. This amendment creates no
new FCC authority; it only permits
the Commission to take into account
trade policies set by the President.
The amendment and the committee
report make clear that the executive
branch makes trade policy: The Com-
mission can make rules consistent with
it, but is not given power to deviate
from the policies of the President.

I commend the chairman of the
Energy and Commerce Committee, the
gentleman from Michigan [Mr. DIN-
GELL]; the chairman of the Telecom-
munications Subcommittee, the gen-
tleman from Massachusetts (Mr.
MARIEYir]; and the ranking Republican
members of the full committee and
subcommittee, Mr. LET and Mr. RIN-
ALDO, for their work on this authoriza-
tion bill. I urge the House to support
it.

Mr. Speaker, I reserve the balance of
my time.

Mr. M ARKEY. Mr. Speaker, I yield
such time as he may consume to the
gentleman from Minnesota [Mr. FREN-
ZEL].

(Mr. FRENZEL asked and was given
permission to revise and extend his re-
marks.)

Mr. FRENZEL. I thank the gentle-
man for yielding.

Mr. Speaker, I rise at the request of
the gentleman from Florida [Mr. GIB-
BONS], chairman of the Subcommittee
on Trade of the Committee on Ways
and Means, in hopes of clarifying our
understanding of section 9 of the bill
on page 6.

Mr. Speaker, in a December 1986
notice of inquiry and proposed rule-
making, the FCC sought public cornm-

October 30, 1989H 7754



October 30, 1989 CONGRESSIONAL RECORD - HOUSE'

ment on whether it can and should
promote trade reciprocity by taking
actions to limit access to the U.S.
market by foreign-owned providers of
telecommunications goods and services
based on whether their home markets
were open or closed. The overwhelm-
ing public response opposed such a
policy, ard the administration, among
others, argued that the FCC has no
statutory authority to take actions
based on a policy of reciprocity with
our trading partners.

In its December 1988 p Iblic state-
ment dropping its notice of irnquiry
and proposed rulemaking, the Com-
mission stated in part that "it believes
that as a matter of policy the Commis-
sion should not take action, including
information collection, solely for trade
purposes.

The United States has an interna-
tional obligation to provide national
treatment-that is, to treat foreign
companies no less favorably than the
most favored domestic companies in
the U.S. market. Moreover, a number
of trade statutes,. includinj the Tele-
communications Trade Act of 1988 and
section 301 of the Trade Act of 1974,
give the President and the U.S. Trade
Representative specific authorities re-
lating to international trade in tele-
communications goods and services.

In the view of the gentleman from
Massachusetts [Mr. NMa.rSK Y]. does the
language of section 9 in any way alter
the FCC's authority in this area or
give it a basis upon which to impose a
policy of reciprocity in its actions af-
fecting foreign providers of goods or
services in the U.S. market?

Mr. LARKEY. Mr. Speaker, will the
gentleman yield?

Mr. FRENZEL. I yield to the gentle-
man from Massachusetts.

Mr. MARTKEY. I thank the gentle-
man for yielding.

Mr. Speaker, no, section 9 does not
alter the PCC's statutory authority in
the area of trade in any way and does
not give that agency the authority to
impose limitations on foreign telecom-
munications providers on the .basis of
a policy of reciprocity.

Mr. 1RENZEL. Mr. Speaker, the
gentleman from Florida [Mr. GsB-
BONS] and I thank the distinguished
subcommittee chairman for the clarifi-
cation.

Mr. MARKEY. Mr. Speaker, I yield
myself 30 seconds so that I may con-
clude.

Mr. Speaker, again we do this legis-
lation on a bipartisan basis. Mr. RIN-
ALDO, Mr. MooRHEAD, Mr. LENT, Mr.
DtNC;LL, myself and all of our subcom-
mittee members, working together;
David Leach, full committee staff
person, working in co,,dination with
the majority and minority staff legis-
lative counsel.

Our goal is to make sure that the
FCC gives our domestic telecommuni-
cations industry a positive, affirmative
way of looking at the opportunities
Which are out there in the field of
telecommunications.

They have a broad jurisdiction: all
the telephone companies, the cable
companies, television companies, you
go right down the line; it is such a
broad jurisdiction with so many key
industries in our country that it is im-
portant that we develop on a biparti-
san basis a view of the world that is
very positive and will give those com-
panies the niche they want in the
American marketplace that will make
us the envy of the world because they
will go out there and make our coun-
try competitive if we have created that
kind of environment.

Our goal is to work together with all
committees in order to accomplish
that goal.

Mr. Speaker, I hope that. the House
will accept our piece of legislation. We
think it is a good one, one that will ad-
vance the long-term interests of our
country.

Mr. MOORHEAD. Mr.. Speaker, I
have no further requests for time, and
I yield back- the balance of my time.

Mr. MARKEY. Mr. Speaker, I have
no further requests for time,, and I
yield back the balance of my time..

The SPEAKER pro tempore (Mr.
MONTGOMERY). The question is on the
motion offered by the gentleman from
Massachusetts [Mr. MARKE]I that the
House suspend the rules and pass the
biJ, H.R. 3265,. as amended.

The question was taken; and (two-
thirds having voted in favor thereof)
the rules were suspended and the bill,
as amended, was passed.

A motion to reconsider was laid on
the table.

GENERAL LEAVE
Mr. MARKEY. Mr. Speaker,. I. ask

unanimous consent that all Members
have 5 legislative days in which to
revise and extend their remarks on
H.R. 3265 the bill just passed.

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Is
there objection to the request of the
gentleman from Massachusetts?

There was no objection.

M.P. DANIEL AN
CALHOON, SR.
BUILDING
Mr. HAYES of I'

I move to suspend th
the bill (H.R. 922) t
building located at 15
Street in Liberty,
Daniel and Thomas
Post Office Building".

The Clerk read as fo
H.R. 92

Be it enacted by the Se
Representatives cf the
America in Congress asv
building located at 15|
Street. in Liberty, Tex:
United States Post Office
nated as the "M.P. Dani
Calhoon, Senior. Post Ofl
relerence to such buildin
regtulation, document, or
United States shqll be die

THOMAS P.
'OST OFFICE

is. Mr. SDeaker,
rules and pass

, designate the
5 Sam Houston
., as the "M.P.
?. Calhoon, Sr.

lows:

late e'id House of
United States of
enlrbed. That the
.5 Sam Houston
;, known as the
Building, is desig-
A1 and Thomas F.
ice Building". Any
i in any law, map,
ither paper of the
nmed to be a refer.

ence to the M.P. Daniel
hoon, Senior, Post Offi

The SPEAKER pr
ant to the rule, a
quired on this motio

The gentleman fr
HAYES] will be reeog
utes, and the gentle
sin [Mr. PETRu: will
20 minutes.

The Chair recogni
from Illinois [Mr. H.

Mr. HAYES of Ili
I yield myself such ti
sume.

Mr. Speaker, not o
nity so blessed that i
outstanding people a
sakes for a public bu
case, however, in Libe
it quite fitting to desi~
Post Office as the "1
Thomas F. Cs1hoon,
Building."

The late M.P. Dnmit
ter in Dayton. TX. I
supporter of. the U`T
throughout his life. I
almost single-handed
Liberty. TX Post
became a reality back.

Mr. Thomas F, C:
commissioned postma
dent William McKiin
Calhoon died in 1937
after more than 17 y
postmaster. His servic
tion In the Calhoon fa
erations of Calhoons
over 50 years to th
postmasters.

Both men are reme
commitment to comm
dedication to progi
County. There is, a g:
port in Liberty for t1
cation, and I urge th
colleagues for this bill

Mr. Speaker. I reser
my time.

Lmd Thomas F. Cal-
Building.
tempore. Pursu-
econd is not re-

m Illinois [Mr.
ized for 20 miin-
an from Wiscon-
,e recognized for

d the gentleman
Es].
)is. Mr. Speaker.
ae as I may con-

ten is a commu-
can look to two
deserving name-
ding. This is the
'ty, TX. I believe
nate the Liberty
¢.P. Daniel and
Sr. Post Office

I was a postmas-
:e was an active

Postal Service
was' due to his

effort. that the
2ffice Building
in the 1930's.
Ihoon, Sr. was
.ter under Presi-
ey in 1897. MMr,
at the: age of 88
.ars as Liberty's
t started a tradi-
mily. Three gem-
lave contributed

community as

abered for their
inity service and
ess in Liberty
,eat deal of sup-
is- building dedi-
rsupport of my

e the balance of

0 131
Mr. PETHPL Mr. , peaker, I yield

myself such time as I nay consume.
The minority has b !en consulted on

this bill, and I am: aformed by the
gentleman frorm N ,w York [Mr.
GILMAN] that the nh ority has no ob-
jection to passage, an feel it is an ap-
propriate piece of leg lation.

Mr. Speaker. I hay no further re-
quests for timre, and yield back the
balance of my time.

Mr. HAYES of Illin is. Mr. Speaker,
I have no further requests for tibme,
and I yield back th( balance of nmy
time.

The SPEAKER p tempore (Mr.
MONTGOMERaY) The q estion is on the
motion offered by th gentleman from
Illinois [Mr. HAYEs] that the House
suspend the rules atd pass the bill,
H.R. 922.

The question was aken;, and (tto-
thirds having voted favor thereof)

H 7755


